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 Charles and Ray Eames developed a toy 
elephant made of plywood in 1945. 
Manufactured in recycled post-industrial 
plastic, the Eames Elephant RE can now 
be enjoyed by the target group for which it 
was originally intended: children – wheth-
er as an indoor-outdoor toy or simply as an 
attractive object for a child’s bedroom. 

∏  Material: dyed-through recycled polypropy-

lene from industrial waste, 100% recyclable, 

matt fi nish.

 Eames Elephant RE 
 Charles & Ray Eames ,  1945 

 Eames Elephant 

 Recycled plastic 

 93 
 sky blue RE 

 17 
 emerald RE 

 41 
 pale rose RE 

 77 
 Eames Red 
Orange RE 

 04 
 white RE 

 18 
 canary RE 

 12 
 deep black RE 

DIMENSIONS

SURFACES AND COLOURS

 www.vitra.com/eameselephant 

The Eames Elephant also comes in 
plywood as well as in the scaled-down 
version Eames Elephant (small) RE made 
of recycled plastic. ∏ Outdoor use: suitable for utilisation out-

doors on a temporary or seasonal basis, 

following care instructions. After prolonged 

exposure to the elements, clean and store 

away in a dry, sheltered place to ensure 

lasting use and avoid any deterioration in 

appearance. 
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 Charles and Ray Eames developed a toy 
elephant made of plywood in 1945. A 
scaled-down version, the Eames Elephant 
(small) made of robust recycled plastic, 
can be used as a child‘s toy or as a 
decorative object, whose friendly face 
adds a charming note to any setting.  

∏  Material: dyed-through post-industrial 

recycled polypropylene, 100% recyclable, 

matt fi nish.

The Eames Elephant also comes in a 
larger version, in recycled plastic or 
elegantly moulded plywood.  

 Eames Elephant (small) RE 
 Charles & Ray Eames ,  1945 

 Eames Elephant (small) RE 

DIMENSIONS

SURFACES AND COLOURS

 Recycled plastic 

 93 
 sky blue RE 

 17 
 emerald RE 

 41 
 pale rose RE 

 77 
 Eames Red 
Orange RE 

 04 
 white RE 

 18 
 canary RE 

 12 
 deep black RE 

 www.vitra.com/eameselephant 

∏ Outdoor applications: suitable for use 

in outdoor conditions on a temporary or 

seasonal basis, following care instructions. 

After prolonged exposure to the elements, 

clean and store away in a dry, sheltered 

place to ensure lasting use and avoid any 

deterioration in appearance. 
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∏  Eames Elephant (plywood)

∏ Material: moulded plywood with face ve-

neer in chestnut or walnut, lacquer fi nish.

∏ Origin of wood: chestnut (Castanea sativa) 

from Slovenia; walnut (Juglans nigra) from 

Austria.

 Charles and Ray Eames developed a toy 
elephant made of plywood in 1945; 
however, this piece never went into 
production. One prototype was shown at 
the Museum of Modern Art in New York in 
1946 and still survives in the Eames family 
archives today. After issuing a fi rst limited 
edition in 2007, Vitra commenced serial 
production of the Eames Elephant in 
plywood in 2018. It is available as a dark 

version in European walnut and a light 
version in chestnut.

The charming pachyderm additionally 
exists as the Eames Elephant RE made of 
recycled post-industrial plastic, which is 
ideal for children, and as a smaller version 
in the same material, Eames Elephant 
(small) RE – both in a choice of assorted 
colours.  

 Eames Elephant (plywood) 
 Charles & Ray Eames ,  1945 

DIMENSIONS

SURFACES AND COLOURS

 Eames Elephant (plywood) 

 Moulded plywood 

 26 
 Chestnut, 
natural, lacquer 
fi nish 

 31 
 Walnut, natural, 
lacquer fi nish 

Materials

Vitra is represented worldwide. Your local Vitra partner can be found at: www.vitra.com. 
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